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Plant Name Information

ASTRANTIA 
'Roma' 

Fast-growing perennial with soft pink 
flowers from June to September. Prefers 
moist soil in sun or partial shade.

BAPTISIA 
‘American Goldfinch' 

A perennial which will do well in poor soil 
and is drought tolerant. Requires full sun.

CAREX 
testacea 

Easy to grow in most well-drained soil and 
thrives in full sun.

CEANOTHUS
'Skylark' 

Evergreen shrub, prefers well drained soil 
and full sun, sheltered from wind.

CEANOTHUS
thyrsiflorus repens 

Fast growing evergreen shrub. Prefers full 
sun and is drought resistant.

CONVOLVULUS
cneorum 

Small evergreen shrub. Great for containers 
and attracts bees. Likes full sun and is 
drought resistant.

DEUTZIA
'Yuki Cherry Blossom' 

Compact deciduous shrub. Prefers well 
drained soil, full sun or partial shade.

ERYSIMUM 
'Super Bowl Sunset' 

An evergreen perennial, fragrant flowers.  
Needs full sun and well drained soil.

EUONYMUS
fortunei 'Emerald 'n' Gold' 

Small evergreen shrub, will grow in sun or 
shade in well drained soil.

EUPHORBIA
 amygdaloides robbiae 

Evergreen perennial, will grow in sun or 
shade and is drought tolerant.
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FATSIA japonica 
'Spider's Web' 

Bushy evergreen shrub. Full or partial shade 
in moist well drained soil. Hardy to -10.

GERANIUM 
x cantabrigiense 'Biokovo' 

Semi- Evergreen perennial. Full sun to full 
shade, moist well-drained soil.

GEUM 
'Mai Tai' 

A perennial which requires full sun and well 
drained moist soil.

HEUCHERA 
‘Lime Rickey' 

Evergreen perennial, full sun or partial 
shade . Drought resistant.

HEUCHERA 
villosa 'Palace Purple' 

Evergreen perennial, full sun or partial 
shade . Drought resistant.

KNAUTIA 
macedonica 'Melton Pastels' 

Great for pollinators. Perennial for full sun 
and well drained soil.

LIQUIDAMBAR
styraciflua 'Gum Ball' 

Deciduous tree, great autumn colour. 
Ultimate height 1.5–2.5 metres. Full sun to 
partial shade.

LYSIMACHIA 
atropurpurea 2L 

Highly attractive to butterflies. Full sun to 
partial shade.

NEPETA 
racemosa 'Walker's Low' 

A perennial which flowers from March to 
September in sun or partial shade.

PITTOSPORUM 
tenuifolium 'Cratus' 

Dense evergreen shrub, requires full sun 
and well drained soil.
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POLYSTICHUM 
setiferum

Hardy evergreen fern, ideal for planting 
underneath deciduous trees, full or partial 
shades

RODGERSIA 
pinnata

A perennial perfect to plant around a pond, 
small star-shaped flowers in large conical 
panicles in summer, full sun to partial 
shade.

SALVIA 
 x sylvestris 'Viola Klose' 

Magnet for butterflies and bees, flowering 
July-September, a hardy perennial. Full sun 
to dappled shade.

SAMBUCUS 
nigra'Black Lace' 

Attractive to wildlife. Deciduous shrub, full 
sun to partial shade. 2.5–4 metres.

SAMBUCUS 
nigra 'Golden Tower' 

Perfect for adding height and colour to a 
small garden. Deciduous shrub, full sun to 
partial shade. 2.5–4 metres.

SPIRAEA 
nipponica 'Snowmound' 

A deciduous shrub that suits most soils. Full 
sun to partial shade.

VIBURNUM 
plicatum 'Watanabe' 

Good for Pollinators. Dense, slow-growing 
shrub, full sun to partial shade.

ERIGERON 
karvinskianus

Drought tolerant, good for bees and other 
pollinators . Full sun to dappled shade.

English shrub Rose
Dannahue 

Thrives in containers, against walls or 
fences. Full sun to partial shade.

English Shrub Rose
Bring me Sunshine (Ausernie) 

Repeat flowering from late spring to early 
winter. Full sun to partial shade.

English Shrub Rose
Lady of Shalott (Ausnyson)

Atrracts bees and ideal for borders. Full sun 
to partial shade.


